
Is
Halloween

A safe fun time

Or rooted in deeper
Evils that have been

Replaced with a facade
To Desensitize the

Actual origins?



Halloween has been adopted 
especially in the Western 
culture from a Dutch tradition 
rooted in Celtic Druid rituals.

Halloween is celebrated on the 
Eve of All Saints Day to 
become Hallow's Eve. But this 
to coincide with the Samhain of
the Druid rituals.

It is called the DAY OF THE 
DEAD where the veil between 
the living and dead are believed
to be the thinnest. This is the 
reason some do seances and 
summon the dead.

The Druids practiced 
debauchery, threatened villages
with curses to gain 
appeasement to their gods of 
evil and Satan. In the old days 
they conducted a real human 
sacrifice, often taking the less 
innocent of the community, 
which eventually because 
anyone they could justify.

Unfortunately that practice and 
its legends became the basis for
our “fun” holiday dubbed as 
HALLOWEEN.

However, religious zealots of 
the other extreme still observe 
it as a real holiday:

Occultists

Witches

Pagans

Satanists

New Agers

Some don't do anything more 
than dance naked in the woods,
but others actually still practice
rituals, dramatize mock 
sacrifices and carry on 
appeasing demonic gods.

However, some Satanists still 
abduct children, practice 
Satanic Ritual abuse, and 
torture people (I have a friend 
who witnessed this).

If you don't believe this, why 
do you dress up in costume in
the name of “fun”? Traditions 
are hard to resist.

Think about why there are 
scary images of horror at this 
time, a reputation of evil, 
mischievousness, debauchery, 
and things like the devil, Satan,
witches, monsters, ghosts, etc?

Because it is more than what 
you imagine associated to bring
about the proxy for this ritual 
and YOU unwittingly 
participate whether you realize 
it or not.

God has given a different plan. 
He says to avoid appearances 
of evil (1Thes 5:22). The Bible 
says to not even partake in 
things of witchcraft, evil, the 
dead (Deuteronomy 18).

God redeems us from sin and 
the ways of the flesh and 
delivers us from evil (Matthew 
6:13, John 3, Romans 10, 
Romans 3)


